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GPP Moral 
sincerity 
declarations

Has the government established a public domain and 
places all details successively, in DAVM form 
regarding GOSIP presented by them consuming 
nation's resources, 

Yes=200;  
No=(-)400

Do all HOG MOG OIG places written undertaking 
recognized by laws that they understand that being in 
nation's governance system, they own the 
responsibility of working in selfless manner, without 
associating selfish interests

Yes=150;  
No=(-)200

Do all MGG places written undertaking recognized by 
laws that they understand that being in nation's 
governance system, they own the responsibility of 
working in selfless manner, without associating selfish 
interests

Yes=150;  
No=(-)200

Do all the HOG, MOG, OIG notify that they have 
recognized the progress and development activities 
made by the other countries which stands better in 
terms of development 

Yes=100;  
No=(-)150

Do the MGG notify that they have recognized the 
progress and development activities made by the other 
countries which stands better in terms of development 

all 100%=100;  
;(-)100 each 
% less

Do the HOG, MOG, OIG (OIG for the district) notify 
that they stand responsible to present DAVM status of 
all public ameinities/services every six months to 
elaborate and prove the development done by them

Yes=100; 
No=(-)200

Do the government mention the location wise 
development, DAVM, of public services as planned 
and the procedure so that a person can verify and 
quantify the extent of development done

Yes=100; 
No=(-)200

Do the HOG, MOG, MGG notify to stand responsible 
for enhancing CEAK of average citizen consistently

Yes=100; 
No=(-)200

COG/ICE 
vigil

Has COG/Constitution/ ICE placed rules testifying 
HOG, MOG, OIG, MGG at National and State/province 
government level against charges of misappropriation 
of nation's resources, misuse of government powers, 
oppress or suppress the common men/citizen (LRG)

Yes=200; 
No=(-)400

Has COG/constitution/ICE instituted rules LRG and 
detailed  the process of investigations on charges of 
misappropriation against HOG, MOG, OIG, MGG (top 
four levels) at National and State/province government 
level or by ICE  placed on public domain with 
stipulations that investigations should complete in 2 

Yes=150;  
No=(-)250

LRG-Laws/Rules for Government; against charges of misappropriation of nation's 

GOVERNMENT SINCERITY- Moral Sincerity INDEX B

Note: This is a modelling, done based upon analysis of existing facts and evolving reasoning, as to how the ‘Government’ and 
‘Constituents of Governance’ are likely to behave and function ‘influenced by normal human attributes’ under different ‘probable 
conditions’ and does not imply projection or criticism of ‘any particular government system in the world’. Any explanation in this 
‘coinciding with any working Government system’ shall be an unintentional coincidence only.
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Has COG/constitution/ICE instituted rules LRG and 
detailed  the process of investigations on charges of 
misappropriation against HOG, MOG, OIG, MGG (top 
four levels) at National and State/province government 
level or by ICE and places details of cases on public 
domain every 15 days by Government and ICE

Yes=150;  
No=(-)250

Has Constitution/ICE instituted rules that at National 
and State/province government level, if investigations 
done by them, must detail the findings of investigations 
on charges of misappropriation against HOG, MOG, 
OIG, MGG (top four levels) on public domain after 
completing investigations in 2 months

Yes=100; 
No=(-)150

Does COG make ICE responsible to monitor the 
progress of LRG investigation cases and places 
detailed progress casewise on its public domain every 
15 days

Yes=100; 
No=(-)150

GOSIP 
evaluation

Are there laws and rules to make mandatory for the 
government to do  'self evaluation' of its GOSIP to 
assess the success/failure and present in DAVM form 
for verification by the people

Yes=100; 
No=(-)150

Do the government notify details of nation's resources 
spent and the quantum of progress made for a period 
not exceeding six months for each GOSIP

Yes=100; 
No=(-)150

assess value 
of decision

Has government instituted /made laws and rules that it 
is mandatory for the government to assess 'Value of a 
Decision' for all decisions costing Rs 1million or more

Yes=100;  
No=(-)250

Has government instituted /made laws and rules that it 
is mandatory for the government to assess 'Value of a 
Decision' for all decisions consuming nation's 
resources Rs 1million or more

Yes=100;  
No=(-)250

Has government instituted /made laws and rules that it 
is mandatory for the government to assess 'Value of a 
Decision' for all decisions effecting nation's population 
1million or more 

Yes=100;  
No=(-)250

Government 
obligations

Is there a rule under COG that the ICE/government 
has no authority to refuse investigation demanded by 
other MOG IOG or Others against their HOG MOG 

Yes=200; 
No=(-)400

Has the ICE instituted a procedure and ruling that no 
demand of any investigation against HOG, MOG, OIG 
can be turned down/refused 

ICE=250; 
Government=(-
)400

Has the government instituted a procedure and ruling 
that no demand of any investigation against HOG, 
MOG, OIG can be turned down/refused 

Yes=200; 
No=(-)400

→

Has ICE/government designed and notified publicly the 
procedure and methodology for conducting 
investigations against any MOG, OIG, MGG1 with 
completion in four months or earlier

Yes=150; 
No=(-)250

→

Has ICE/government designed and notified publicly the 
procedure and methodology for conducting 
investigations against any MOG, OIG, MGG1 for 
criminal cases with completion in four months or earlier

Yes=150; 
No=(-)250
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→ Is investigating agency appointed by ICE or the 
HOG/MOG -Government

ICE=150; 
Government=(-
) 250

→
Number of candidates of ruling/Government's party 
officially announced , with having charges of criminal 
offence before an election (with CRAG available)

Yes=150; 
No=(-)250

→
Number of candidates of ruling/Government's party 
officially announced , with having charges of criminal 
offence before an election (without CRAG available)

Yes=50; No=(-
)250

→

Has Government launched openly and freely 
accessible public domain for inputing complaints 
against HOG, MOG, OIG, PL or political party with 
video/audio evidence without disclosing ID

Yes=150; 
No=(-)250

→

Number of charges of corruption, anti-nationalism, anti 
social integrity-ism, irregularity, misuse of power,  on 
the HOG, MOG, IOG of ruling party with video/audio 
evidence

Yes=150; 
No=(-)250 
each case

→

Government notify the 'democracy index' of each 
district/unit region every six months specifying reasons 
if there is no improvement of more than 2.5% score 
during six months

Yes=150; 
No=(-)200

 Government notify the average citizen value of each 
district/unit region every six months specifying reasons 
if there is no improvement of more than 2.5% score 
during six months

Yes=150; 
No=(-)200

Government notify the citizen Independence index of 
each district/unit region every six months specifying 
reasons if there is no improvement of more than 2.5% 
score during six months

Yes=150; 
No=(-)200

Government notify the public services index of all 
public services of each district/unit region every six 
months specifying reasons if there is no improvement 
of more than 2.5% score during six months

Yes=150; 
No=(-)200

Investiganion
s for GPP

Action by Government on Charges of Corruption ; 
irregularity; moral trafficking on HOG MOG IOG MMG 
(A)Denial by government/ party/ same organization 
within 48hrs without evidence to substantiate(B) Denial 
later without investigation  

(-)150 each 
case

 investigation started in 5 days (A)each case  for own 
government and party members and (B) for other party 
and members

Ruling 
party=200 ; 
others=100 
each case

investigation concluded in 2 months (A)each case  for 
own government and party members and (B) for other 
party and members

Ruling 
party=250 ; 
others=100 
each case

investigations not concluded in 2 months each case
(-)250 each 
case

Investigation assigned to government unit/organ
(-)250 each 
case

Investigation by ICE with non-government unit Yes=200

Number cases in which HOG, MOG IOG MMG held 
responsible

>80%=200; 
<80%=(-)25 
each % less
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Number of cases in which No HOG,MOG,IOG,PL held 
responsible and the actual culprit/guilty is also not 
notified/produced

(-)150 each 
case

After investigation if HOG/MOG/OIG/PL held 
responsible and subsequently: (A)continue in position 
or debar <2years alongwith legal punishment; 
(B)Debarred for minimum 2 years alongwith legal 

A=(-)200 each 
case; B=200 
each case

Number of cases investigated for own party/ 
government within 2 months-last two years data (CI1)

all 100%=150; 
<100%=(-)100 
each % less 

 Number of cases investigated for others within two 
months-two years data (CI2)

all 100%=100; 
<100%=(-)100 
each % less 

Is there a rule that details of all above items CI1, CI2 to 
be published on public domain by government every 
two months

Yes=100;  
No=(-)150

Is government publishing the data of CI1, CI2 as above 
on public domain

Yes=100;  
No=(-)250

Experts 
leaving 
country

Are the highly educated, qualified people (HEQ) 
especially from the fields of Engineering, medical 
science, science stream, mathematics, econonmics, 
finanace, business administration, leaving the country Yes=(-)250
Is the number of HEQ people increasing during past 
five years with government notifying data yearwise

Yes=(-)150;  
No=100

If increasing, % of HEQ leaving compared to previous 
year (more than previous year) to be summed for past 
five years

summed up 
>100%=(-)200

% of HEQ  out of who left during last twenty years and 
not returned to settle permanent basis

100%=(-)250; 
10 each % 
less

Number of HEQ left more than ten years back and 
returned

50 (each 25 
persons)

Do government issues number of HEQ nationals who 
left the country yearwise for last twenty years, notify 
trend every year

Yes=100; 
No=(-)150;

Do government issues number of HEQ nationals who 
left the country yearwise for last twenty years, notify the 
reasons of their leaving the country mentioning why 
they did not stay

Yes=100; 
No=(-)250;

Any statement by HEQ settled abroad that the success 
they achieved there, could not have been achieved in 
the original native country

Yes=(-
)150each 
case;  

Any statement by HEQ settled abroad and achieved 
international award/recognition there, that the success 
they achieved there, could not have been achieved in 
the original native country

(-)200 each 
person

No Fame 
game

Are relevant laws rules instituted by the 
ICE/government that no GPP would notify its 
achievements on places other than official public 

Yes=100;  
No=(-)200

Are the rules instituted  that the GPP (HOG, MOG, 
OIG, MGG) would not notify government's 
achievements with their name and photographs

Yes=100;  
No=(-)200
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Are the rules instituted that the GPP, HOG, MOG, OIG, 
MGG if notify government's achievements with their 
names and photographs, the GOSIP shall be 
considered personally owned by GPP and the cost of 
GOSIP to be charged from GPP

Yes=100;  
No=(-)200

Are the rules instituted  that if GPP (HOG, MOG, OIG, 
MGG) would notify government's achievements with 
their name and photographs, it will be considered as 
an act of corruption and misuse of government position

Yes=100;  
No=(-)200

Fotas
Are there cases in which GPP/DH/DPH declare that a 
well known person/prominent person was doing 
unlawful for last two months Yes=(-)100;  
Are there cases in which GPP/DH/DPH or media 
/madiak declare that a well known person/prominent 
person was doing unlawful for last one year or more Yes=(-)200;  
Any evidence that the GPP, DH, DPH of the area met 
the prominent person during last one year at some 
place

Yes=(-)50 
each 
occassion

Any evidence that the HOG, MOG, OIG,PL of the area 
met the prominent person during last one year at some 
place

Yes=(-)50 
each 
occassion

Any evidence that the GPP, DH, DPH of the area met 
the prominent person during last one year at the place 
which is related to an act which is labelled as unlawful

Yes=(-)200 
each 
occassion

Any evidence that the HOG, MOG, OIG,PL of the area 
met the prominent person during last one year at the 
place which is related to an act which is labelled as 
unlawful

Yes=(-)150 
each 
occassion
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